Town of West Tisbury Schedule of Departmental Bills Payable Zoning Board of Appeals

Aggregate Total:		833.00
Warrant Date:	7/1	0/2020

To the Town Accountant:

The following-named bills of the **Zoning Board of Appeals** in the total amount shown above have been approved by the department head, and you are requested to place them on the warrant for payment.

				7/10/2020
	Submitted by			Date
Vendor				
(Payment To:)	Address	Invoice #	Amount	Appropriation
MV Times	PO Box 518 Vineyard Haven MA 02568	6/30/2020		5346
Payroll	Pamela Thors	7/3/2020	2320.50	
Reynolds Rappaport Kaplan & Hackney, LLC	PO Box 2540 Edgartown, MA 02539	6/30/2020	833.00	5305
daRosas MV Printing	PO Box1668 Oak Bluffs, MA 02557	6/30/2020	136.98	5420
Total		·	3290.48	

Chair-signature

Date

7/2/2020



Advertising Statement

Martha's Vineyard Times PO Box 518 / 30 Beach Road, Vinevard Haven MA 02568

Tel : (508) 693 6100 Email:adsales@mvtimes.com

West Tisbury ZBA

P.O. Box 278 West Tisbury, MA 02575

Cust#: 2254 (Contd) Tel#: (508) 696-0100

Statement Date: 06/30/20

Salesperson: Default Salesperson

Detailed Statement of transactions between 06/01/20 to 06/30/20

Total for Ad 92.70

WEST TISBURY ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS NO ...

MVTimes Web Classified, 12 ins., 06/16/20... 0.00 MVTimes, 2 ins., 06/25/20 - 07/02/20 104.40

Total for Ad 104.40

> Total for invoice 279.00 1,353.89 279.00

06/30/20 REMOVE SERVICE CHARGES -16.16 -16.16 1,337.73

> Balance Due 1,337.73

Summary

Balance forward 1,617.99 587.70 Total Charges Total Credits -867.96

90+ days 120+ days Balance Due 30+ days 60+ days Current 1,337.73 0.00 0.00 571.54 540.86 225.33



Martha's Vineyard Times PO Box 518 / 30 Beach Road, Vineyard Haven MA 02568

Tel: (508) 693 6100 Email:adsales@mvtimes.com

Advertising Statement

West Tisbury ZBA

P.O. Box 278 West Tisbury, MA

02575

Cust#: 2254

Tel#: (508) 696-0100

Statement Date: 06/30/20

Salesperson: Default Salesperson

Detailed Statement of transactions between 06/01/20 to 06/30/20

Date	Description	Charge	Amount	Balance
06/04/20	Balance forward as of 05/31/20 Invoice #: 619 Advertising			1,617.99
00/04/20	WEST TISBURY Special Permit from Debra Co	edeno		
	MVTimes, 1 ins., 06/04/20 - 06/04/20	47.70		
	Total for Ad	47.70		
	WEST TISBURYZONING BOARD OF APPEA	LSNO		
	MVTimes, 1 ins., 06/04/20 - 06/04/20	52.20		
	Tot <u>al for Ad</u>	52.20		
	Total for invoice	99.90	99.90	1,717.89
06/11/20	Invoice #: 789 Advertising			
	WEST TISBURY ZONING BOARD OF APPEA			
	MVTimes, 1 ins., 06/11/20 - 06/11/20	59.85		
	Total for Ad	59.85		
	WEST TISBURY ZONING BOARD OF APPEA			
	MVTimes, 1 ins., 06/11/20 - 06/11/20	44.55		
	Total for Ad			
	Total for invoice	104.40	104.40	1,822.29
06/18/20	Invoice #: 967 Advertising			
•	WEST TISBURY ZONING BOARD OF APPEA			
	MVTimes, 1 ins., 06/18/20 - 06/18/20	59.85		
	Total for Ad			
	WEST TISBURY ZONING BOARD OF APPEA			
	MVTimes, 1 ins., 06/18/20 - 06/18/20	44.55		
	Total for Ad		404.40	4.000.00
	Total for invoice	104.40	104.40	1,926.69
06/23/20	Payment - CHECK Ref # *********7941	-851.80	-851.80	1,074.89
06/25/20	Invoice #: 1161 Advertising			
	WEST TISBURY ZONING BOARD OF APPEA	ALS NO		
	MVTimes Web Classified, 12 ins., 06/23/20	0.00		
	MVTimes, 2 ins., 06/25/20 - 07/02/20	81.90		
	Total for Ad			
	WEST TISBURY ZONING BOARD OF APPEA			
	MVTimes Web Classified, 12 ins., 06/23/20			
	MVTimes, 2 ins., 06/25/20 - 07/02/20	92.70		

TOWN OF WEST TISBURY

ZBA Pamela Thors Department: Employee:

Pay Period Ending:

															00.00	33.15	000
Special	etail Hours														0.00	\$33.15	00 00
	Vacation Detail Hours									3.50					3.50	33.15	146.00
urs Taken	Sick														0.00	\$33.15	ç
Leave Hours Taken	Personal														00.00	33.15	ć
	Holiday													7.00	7.00	\$33.15	0
	Other														0.00	33.15	6
Hours Worked	Overtime														00.0	\$33.15	6
Hor	Regular	7.00	7.00	7.00	7.00	7.00			7.00	3.50		7.00	7.00		59.50	33.15	
	Date-FY20	6/22/20	6/23/20	6/24/20	6/25/20	6/26/20	6/27/20	6/28/20	6/29/20	6/30/20	Date-FY21	7/1/20	7/2/20	7/3/20	Total:	Pay Rate:	1

\$2,320.50 ly types combined) Gross Pay for Period:

Department Head or Board Approval:

	and whether weekends count toward the seven days.			
Jun-09-20	Re: ZBA/Larkosh - Various e-mails with Pam Thors; legal research re: Larkosh claims of construction grant.	0.50	122.50	MAG
Jun-10-20	Conference call with town counsels' association re- restaurant reopenings and rules and protocols for same.	0.20	49.00	RHR
	Re: ZBA/Larkosh - Review case law and memo re Larkosh request for a constructive grant; follow-up with Michael Goldsmith re; same.	0.50	122.50	RHR
	Re: Annual Town Meeting - Review of explanation of warrant article to fund the County and review revised warrant in final form.	0.70	171.50	RHR
	Re: ZBA/Larkosh - Telephone call with Town Clerk; e-mails with ZBA Administrator; follow-up re: Larkosh petition.	0.40	98.00	MAG
Jun-11-20	Exchange of e-mails with Jen Rand and Jack Collins re: ability to take temperature of municipal employees.	0.20	49.00	RHR
	Re: ZBA/Larkosh - Review Board decision re: Larkosh appeal; follow-up with Pam Thors; draft letter for Town Clerk.	1.10	269.50	MAG
Jun-12-20	Review recent guidance re: restaurant and requirements for outdoor seating issued by the Mass Department of Public Health.	0.20	49.00	RHR
	Re: ZBA/Larkosh - Revise letter to Larkosh Trust re: constructive grant.	0.50	122.50	MAG
Jun-15-20	Re: Annual Town Meeting - Attend review meeting with Jen Rand and Dan Waters; follow-up review of various warrant items and prepare for Annual Town Meeting.	1.50	367.50	RHR
	Re: ZBA/Larkosh - Follow-up with constructive grant letter re: Larkosh Trust.	0.20	49.00	MAG
Jun-17-20	Conference call with municipal attorneys; review dining protocols and other COVID-related directives from the State and Federal Government.	0.20	49.00	RHR
	Re: ZBA/Larkosh - Follow-up with Pam Thors re: Larkosh constructive grant questions.	0.20	49.00	MAG
Jun-18-20	Telephone calls with Jen Rand re: Governor's orders re: outdoor food establishments.	0.10	24.50	RHR

Ministration | Land of the proposed and the Commission of the Comm

833.N

	w.T board of Appens							
1 1		QTY,			DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	AMOU	NT
ļ	. ·		BX S	160	LABOS		39	99
	1		134 1	2113	FOLDERS		- 11	99
33130283	Account Number 42465				•			
,	daRosa							
DARIOSA CORP CAK BLUFFS MA 02557	Corporation							
	Box 1668 . Oak Bluffs, MA 02557							
	Martha's Vineyard Printing Company daRosa's Office Products & Artist Supplies							
	daRosa's Computer Service Telephone 508-693-0110/Fax 508-693-5546				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
DARO	Teachnoire 200-032-0110/Lax 200-032-2240							
<i>IDI#</i> dd	☐ CREDIT CARD 129 20 HOUSE CHARGE ☐ DEPOSIT MONTH DAY YEAR	X _	•			SUB .	51	98
	THOUSE CHARGE DEPOSIT MONTH ON YEAR	DEPT.	GNATURE			. SALES		
	CLERK		STO		INVOICE 835614	TOTAL	51	98
	The solution of the solution o						1	* 7

WT ZONING	GTY. DESCRIPTION	UNIT PAKE	AMOUNT
42740	500 10R Enuel		American Ame
daRosa Corporation Box1668 • Oak Bluffs, MA 02557 Martha's Vineyard Printing Company daRosa's Computer Service daRosa's Office Products Telephone 508-693-0110/Fax 508-693-5546			
ASH PAYMENT 30 00	SERVATURE SALES DO 4 4 4 1	SUB TOTAL SALES TAX TOTAL	8500

À